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0 - Artificial Saiyan

Journal Entry 202-

I have Discovered A New Element of power. The Saiyan race. Some How they manage so Much power
AND Are able to transform into a monster. Goku's Advatage will be his dimize! With My knowlegde and
the Saiyan race I will be unstopable...
First Goku Than the Earth!

Transmission Interupted

-Dr. Gero

Dr. Gero, Pasted the Day of this entry. Though he may be gone his Dream will always be alive! His
Computer Kept Going On and on until... One Fatal Day when Super Android 13 was destroied His
Computer Shut down. But then a Spirtual Force of Some kind Awakened the computer once more... But
with Dr. Gero's Last Entry open the Second of Awakenment. Now the Computer is off to create a new
warrior... The Perfect Warrior...



http://www.fanart-central.net/story-51692.html *Link to the real story

http://www.fanart-central.net/story-51692.html


1 - Artficial Saiyan 1





This was a very good first try. But I am Sorry to say that it has tom much of the ape gene.

Unstable in ape form. Very Primitive.

Attack technique- Drunken Stripe

*Note-

The image is kinda blurry. Most images will be until about the 30th Saiyan posted TY I hope you like it*



2 - 2





By Applying more humanoid Gene that is contained within the saiyan Gene it created this Artificial
Saiyan. But by have Adding to Much Of the Gene I seem to have given him 4 arms.

Attack technique- Power Walts



3 - 3





Learning from My mistakes; I took away some of the humanoid gene. But by doing so I have Given this
Saiyan 2 tails.

Unstable in ape form.

Attack technique- Twisted Comet



4 - 4





When i took away the Gene that created the extra Tail I thought that the problem would be fixed. But this
one has no tail. My First Female I have created.

Unstable in ape Form

Attack - Loving Power Pulsation



5 - 5





The Genes were all correct but this spesiman was created without an arm. I attached a robotic one to
replace it.

Attack- Moon lit Bullet



6 - 6





I slightly altered the DNA from before and tryed again. The spesamn came out with out it's right leg.

Attack technique- Kick Boxing tornado



7 - 7





I fixed the problem with the previous 2 Artificial Saiyans, But with this new formula I have created an
even Bigger problem. This Saiyan is Majorly Obese.

Attack Technique- Crushing Power surge



8 - 8





I Subtracted the Fat Gene from the DNA Arrangment. But by doing so this Saiyan is all Skin and Bones.

Attack technique- Thin Slice

unstable in ape form



9 - 9



This Specimen is too short. His Height is 2'2. My Data suggests that something went wrong when I
equalized the Fat gene.



Attack Technique- Trippin' Bite

Unstable in ape form



10 - 10





I modified the DNA but I Might have put to much in for this Specimen...

Attack technique- Headbut bullet

Unstable in ape Form





Uh Oh... It's Rage Shenron... You better get that dragon ball away from him!

Go research and try to find away to beat him with useing your power WHICH could damage the Dark
Star dragon ball!



11 - 11





This Specimen some how turned out with 2 heads. I will Have to Check my Data base for more
information on how to change this.

Attack Technique- Double Header!

Unstable in ape form



12 - 12



This Saiyan Has Large Ears. Looks like My Database is Corrupt. By Fixing the Previous Problems with
the last Experiment It caused More Problems with the Head and Skull area.



Attack Technique- Sensitive Strike

Unstable in ape form



13 - 13





MY Second Female Creation. It is absent of an amune system.

Attack Technique- Decorative Drain

Unstable in ape Form



14 - 14





I tried to fix the internal organs but it came out with an enlarged tung.

Attack Technique- Acid Saliva

Unstable in ape form



15 - 15





Half Way into his development His Neck Began to become longer.



16 - 16





I went back to previous Formula's and Thought Combined with my New Knowledge of the Neck and
Tung Problems I could Be finished. But the Saiyan Created Had 6 Arms. Very Unplaned, my data base
should be able to complete it.

Attack Technique- Tornado Blits

Unstable in ape form



17 - 17





This Specimen was Created with 4 tails. I'm Feeling Deja Vu...

Attack Technique- entangle

Unstable In Ape Form



18 - 18





I Fixed what Problems I have currently Had. According to my Data Base this Saiyan shouldn't have any
problems. But he has 3 eyes. I will investigate further into this problem.

Attack Technique- Trinhalation

Unstable in ape form



19 - 19





I have fixed the problem or 3 eyes by removing a forth of the gene. But it seems to have back fired
creating a Being with 1 eye.

Attack Technique- Unablow

unstable in ape form



20 - 20





Becuz of the absence in the gene that carry's the eye, I Added 1/3rd more. but By doing so giving the
Saiyan eyes all around it's skull.

Attack Technique- Blink Bomb

Unstable in ape form



21 - 21





It's Microscopic. This Came About when I tried to make the Power Lvl of a creation on detectable. But it
made Him Undetectable.

Attack Technique- Tic Tac Toe

Unstable in ape form



22 - 22





Still Just as small as before Just heavier in Power and in density.

Attack Technique- Berry Beam

Unstable In ape form



23 - 23





Normal Size. It's still a child, But it is Heavy With Power and density like #22

Attack Technique- CrackCrill

Unstable In Ape form



24 - 24

It's Lims are To Small and it's Body Is round. My Data Base Suggests to remove and add more genes.

Attack technique- rolling Mountain



Unstable In Ape form

uh Oh It's Oceanous Shenron!

You Better go Research on how to kill it without Hurting the Dragon Ball!



25 - 25





It's Lims Are to big while it's body is to small. Looks like my Data Was Wrong.

Attack technique- Large Loud

Unstable in Ape form



26 - 26

It's Body is Normal Size but it's Arms and Hands are Twice the size of a bulldozer.

Attack Technique- Senile Bulldozer



Unstable in ape form



27 - 27





This Specimen is unable to sleep. I didn't see this in my data.

Attack technique- Rapid Miniature Missile

Unstable in Ape Form



Uh Oh... It's Naturon Shenron... You better get that dragon ball away from him!

Go research and try to find away to beat him with useing your power WHICH could damage the Dark
Star dragon ball!



28 - 28

By Equalizing the Genes of #27 for this Specimen I created a being that has almost no energy.

Attack technique- Dream Driller



Unstable in ape form



29 - 29





This Specimen has Little legs, giving it the disadvantage of speed and flying imbalances.

attack technique- Spiraling Ape

Unstable in ape form



30 - 30





I added mor e genes to make the legs longer. But when it was created The Legs turned out to Long.
This Specimen has Trouble running.

Attack technique- Splitting Sword

Unstable in ape form



31 - 31





This Saiyan has only 1 Gaint Lung. It may Have Troubles with breathing.

Attack technique- Imploding Inhalation

Unstable in ape form



32 - 32





By Adding more genes to this DNA I created a Saiyan Who Breathes Carbon dioxide. If I inhance the
Power Levels maybe Problems will stop.

Attack Technique- Green House effect

Unstable in ape form



33 - 33





I have yet to increase the power lvls but when I created this It had no nose.

Attack Technique- Cuddle Crush

Unstable in ape form



34 - 34





I tried to Fix the Problem with #33 but Sadly it came out with 4 nastrals.

Attack Technique- Snot trap

Unstable in ape form



35 - 35





I increased the power. This is Female So Results May Vary On gender... But it Seems It's Skin is green.

Attack Technique- Natures Revenge

unstable in ape form



36 - 36





It Seems that this Specimen is COMPLETELY unstable! It May be the increase in power...

Attack Technique- Self destruction Disk

unstable in ape form



37 - 37





It has No ears. It's Other senses are sharper than others. I will try to modifie the DNA for the next one.

Attack technique- Magnifie Sight

unstable in ape form



38 - 38





This Specimen's DNA has changed alot from the last one. It has Rock Skin.

Attack Technique- Tecktonic Crush

Unstable in ape form



39 - 39





When It was created it had no skin. So I modifie it so it's outer shell is nothing but steal.

Attack Technique- Hard reg

Unstable in ape form



40 - 40-41

I have made a new break thru. All Saiyans Before Were Unstable in ape form, But I had Planted a small
gene in their DNA So they will be able to fuse with each other. But they were unable to defuse. Now I am
Trying to Perfect that Gene So that future Generations will be able to become more powerful...

Attack Technique- I've got your Back



Unstable in ape form



41 - 42-49





When Created, each of these had a gene that Attracted them to each other. But By Doing so Only
attached them by the tail, Making them forever unable to fuse or Detach.

Attack Technique- Power Addiction Blits

unstable in ape form



42 - 50-52





When I Fused this Saiyan Together The surrounding DNA was combined and Doubled the Ape Gene
Making it to Hairy.

Attack Technique- Bloody Blade

Unstable in ape form



43 - 53-54





When Combining to make this Saiyan, the gene's and molecular structor that creats the Arms was
double creating this...

Attack Technique- Bones to Dust

Unstable in ape form



44 - 57-58





When Combining their Cellular Structor their Heads stayed in tacted... My Data Base Suggests Data
That may fix the problem...

Attack Technique- Head Bomb

Unstable in ape Form



777 - Your wish is at my Command



Hey, Just an announcement... A little contest is going on SPECIALLY for this story! And All you've gota
do... IS FIND THAT DRAGON BALL! The Dragon Balls will be spread out on this story. And If you find
them all You Get A Prize. But it Won't Be that easy... Every time You Find a Dragon Ball I will Move the
Dragon Ball then to this Page Or Scatter them all out again so It's harder to find them.

Just remember to Post the Links to the chapters on this Page ^^ or just the chapter #.

Also Remember there are about 3 sets Of Dragon Balls, And if you find 1, it might not match the rest.
And Sometimes I Will Make the Dragon Balls Corrupt Like in Dragon Ball GT and you will have
challenges to face to get the dragon balls back to normal.

People Who Have Found anything so far-

FalloutGirlAARHinder-
4 earth, 0 Nameik, 0 Dark, 0 Special





Here Are the Prizes(They Vary On which Set of Dragon Balls You get)-

Earth, 1 wish:
- Submit Fan art of this story, with side info and have it posted here
- Small Decision
- Let you add a New Character to our story
- Let you Add a New VILLAIN to our story
- Character Upgrade and Power Ups

Namikian, 2 Wishes:
- Request a Picture
- 1 question about future events of the story
- Short Story About your Character
- 1 kid for future seasons of the Story (Or having a kid from the future greet u)
- 1 decision

Dark, 1 wish:



- Movie Premier Staring your character
- Make your Character switch Sides in the story
- Your Own Arch Foe
- 1 side story
- Have your Character Fuse with another in the Story

Special, 1 wish:
- Dragon Interview
- Your Character (Interview)
- Create a Warrior Race
- Create A Planet
- Create A Tale
- Small Decision
- Let you add a New Character to our story
- Let you Add a New VILLAIN to our story
- Character Upgrade and Power Ups
- Make your Character switch Sides in the story
- Your Own Arch Foe
- 1 major pet in the story
- Have your Character Fuse with another in the Story
- 1 question about future events of the story
- Short Story About your Character
- 1 kid for future seasons of the Story Or having a kid from the future greet u)
- 1 decision
- 1 side story
- Create a War
- Create a Battle
- Create A fusion
- Get the "Dragon Radar"
- (Side story) GO to tournament
- 1 ride on Nimbus
- Picture with your fave Character
- Your Own Crew
- "Legendary Troubles"- Your Races Ultimate Creature
- Request a Quest
- Request a Wish...

I might Add more, But you Get the Point...

(This Contest Will Never End As long As there are Dragon Balls)



WHY ARE YOU STILL LOOKING AT
THIS PAGE! GO FIND THOSE...
DRAGON BALLS!
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